

SIGNATURE PAGE

RFQ# F-17-2024

To the Board of County Commissioners of the County of Monmouth:

**THE UNDERSIGNED HEREBY DECLARES THAT
I (WE) HAVE CAREFULLY EXAMINED THE SPECIFICATIONS.
I (WE) HEREBY CERTIFY PRICES QUOTED ARE IN ACCORDANCE
WITH YOUR REQUIREMENTS.**

Company Name: Protect Building Materials DBA Liberty Building Products
(PRINT)

Preparer's Name: John C Russo
(PRINT)

Signature: John C Russo
(DATE)

Address: 193 Christie Street
Newark, NJ 07105

Telephone No.: 908-276-5122

Fax No.: 908-276-7205

E-Mail Address: JLoBasso@Libertywoodmaterials.com

*****(This should be the email where Contracts would be sent)*****

Contact Person: John LoBasso

FEIN: _____
(Federal Employee ID)

(Revised 9/2015)

2024 Monmouth County Request for Bid - Lumber

Group One

Douglas Fir, stamped S-GRN, and stamped as to the grade of lumber.

ALL GROUP ONE PRICES MUST BE PER PIECE

1.	(1) 2 x 4 x 7' 8 5/8" DOUGLAS FIR STUD GRADE	\$ <u>4.55 each</u>
2.	(1) 2 x 4 x 8' DOUGLAS FIR, #2 & BETTER	\$ <u>4.65 each</u>
3.	(1) 2 x 4 x 10' DOUGLAS FIR, #2 & BETTER	\$ <u>5.75 ea</u>
4.	(1) 2 x 4 x 12' DOUGLAS FIR, #2 & BETTER	\$ <u>7.45 ea</u>
5.	(1) 2 x 4 x 14' DOUGLAS FIR, #2 & BETTER	\$ <u>8.05 ea</u>
6.	(1) 2 x 4 x 16' DOUGLAS FIR, #2 & BETTER	\$ <u>9.15 ea</u>
7.	(1) 2 x 4 x 20' DOUGLAS FIR, #2 & BETTER	\$ <u>12.75 ea</u>
8.	(1) 2 x 6 x 8' DOUGLAS FIR, #2 & BETTER	\$ <u>6.90 ea</u>
9.	(1) 2 x 6 x 10' DOUGLAS FIR, #2 & BETTER	\$ <u>8.60 ea</u>
10.	(1) 2 x 6 x 12' DOUGLAS FIR, #2 & BETTER	\$ <u>10.35 ea</u>
11.	(1) 2 x 6 x 14' DOUGLAS FIR, #2 & BETTER	\$ <u>12.20 ea</u>
12.	(1) 2 x 6 x 16' DOUGLAS FIR, #2 & BETTER	\$ <u>13.75 ea</u>
13.	(1) 2 x 6 x 20' DOUGLAS FIR, #2 & BETTER	\$ <u>16.50 ea</u>
14.	(1) 2 x 8 x 8' DOUGLAS FIR, #2 & BETTER	\$ <u>8.80 ea</u>
15.	(1) 2 x 8 x 10' DOUGLAS FIR, #2 & BETTER	\$ <u>11.00 ea</u>
16.	(1) 2 x 8 x 12' DOUGLAS FIR, #2 & BETTER	\$ <u>13.20 ea</u>
17.	(1) 2 x 8 x 14' DOUGLAS FIR, #2 & BETTER	\$ <u>15.40 ea</u>

VENDOR NAME: Exter Building Products DBA Liberty Building Products

Group One (Continued)

18.	(1) 2 x 8 x 16' DOUGLAS FIR, #2 & BETTER	\$ <u>18.⁰⁰_{ea}</u>
19.	(1) 2 x 8 x 20' DOUGLAS FIR, #2 & BETTER	\$ <u>22.50_{ea}</u>
20.	(1) 2 x 10 x 8' DOUGLAS FIR, #2 & BETTER	\$ <u>12.75_{ea}</u>
21.	(1) 2 x 10 x 10' DOUGLAS FIR, #2 & BETTER	\$ <u>15.90_{ea}</u>
22.	(1) 2 x 10 x 12' DOUGLAS FIR, #2 & BETTER	\$ <u>19.10_{ea}</u>
23.	(1) 2 x 10 x 14' DOUGLAS FIR, #2 & BETTER	\$ <u>22.25_{ea}</u>
24.	(1) 2 x 10 x 16' DOUGLAS FIR, #2 & BETTER	\$ <u>27.50_{ea}</u>
25.	(1) 2 x 10 x 20' DOUGLAS FIR, #2 & BETTER	\$ <u>31.⁰⁰_{ea}</u>
26.	(1) 2 x 12 x 8' DOUGLAS FIR, #2 & BETTER	\$ <u>18.35_{ea}</u>
27.	(1) 2 x 12 x 10' DOUGLAS FIR, #2 & BETTER	\$ <u>22.95_{ea}</u>
28.	(1) 2 x 12 x 12' DOUGLAS FIR, #2 & BETTER	\$ <u>27.50_{ea}</u>
29.	(1) 2 x 12 x 14' DOUGLAS FIR, #2 & BETTER	\$ <u>33.¹⁰_{ea}</u>
30.	(1) 2 x 12 x 16' DOUGLAS FIR, #2 & BETTER	\$ <u>42.⁰⁰_{ea}</u>
31.	(1) 2 x 12 x 20' DOUGLAS FIR, #2 & BETTER	\$ <u>54.25_{ea}</u>
32.	(1) 4 x 4 x 10' DOUGLAS FIR, #2 & BETTER	\$ <u>17.75_{ea}</u>
33.	(1) 5/4 x 3 x 8' SPRUCE #3 OR BETTER FURRING STRIP	\$ <u>3.50_{ea}</u>
34.	(1) 5/4 x 2 x 16' SPRUCE #3 OR BETTER FURRING STRIP	\$ <u>6.⁰⁰_{ea}</u>
35.	(1) 1" x 12" x 16' PINE, #2	\$ <u>24.⁰⁰_{ea}</u>

TOTAL GROUP ONE: \$ 587.45

VENDOR NAME: Protect Building Materials DBA Liberty Building Products

Group Two- Wolmanized Lumber- Pressure treated #2 or better SYP

ALL GROUP TWO PRICES MUST BE PER PIECE

36.	(1) 1 x 4 x 8'	\$ <u>4.40 ea</u>
37.	(1) 1 x 4 x 12'	\$ <u>6.25 ea</u>
38.	(1) 1 x 4 x 16'	\$ <u>8.80 ea</u>
39.	(1) 5/4 x 6 x 8'	\$ <u>7.50 ea</u>
40.	(1) 5/4 x 6 x 12'	\$ <u>10.50 ea</u>
41.	(1) 5/4 x 6 x 16'	\$ <u>14.40 ea</u>
42.	(1) 2 x 2 x 36" BALUSTERS	\$ <u>2.40 ea</u>
43.	(1) 2 x 2 x 48" BALUSTERS	\$ <u>2.80 ea</u>
44.	(1) 2 x 4 x 8'	\$ <u>5.85 ea</u>
45.	(1) 2 x 4 x 10'	\$ <u>7.25 ea</u>
46.	(1) 2 x 4 x 12'	\$ <u>8.70 ea</u>
47.	(1) 2 x 4 x 16'	\$ <u>12.75 ea</u>
48.	(1) 2 x 4 x 20'	\$ <u>16.75 ea</u>
49.	(1) 2 x 6 x 8'	\$ <u>5.90 ea</u>
50.	(1) 2 x 6 x 10'	\$ <u>10.10 ea</u>
51.	(1) 2 x 6 x 12'	\$ <u>10.90 ea</u>
52.	(1) 2 x 6 x 16'	\$ <u>14.75 ea</u>
53.	(1) 2 x 6 x 20'	\$ <u>21. -</u>
54.	(1) 2 x 8 x 8'	\$ <u>9.90 ea</u>

VENDOR NAME: Estect Buldy Materials TBA Liberty Buldy Products

Group Two (Continued)

55.	(1) 2 x 8 x 10'	\$ <u>12.40_g</u>
56.	(1) 2 x 8 x 12'	\$ <u>15.10_g</u>
57.	(1) 2 x 8 x 16'	\$ <u>19.80_g</u>
58.	(1) 2 x 8 x 20'	\$ <u>25.25_g</u>
59.	(1) 2 x 10 x 8'	\$ <u>13.15_g</u>
60.	(1) 2 x 10 x 10'	\$ <u>17.90_g</u>
61.	(1) 2 x 10 x 12'	\$ <u>22.50_g</u>
62.	(1) 2 x 10 x 16'	\$ <u>28.90_g</u>
63.	(1) 2 x 10 x 20'	\$ <u>39.50_g</u>
64.	(1) 2 x 12 x 8'	\$ <u>15.50_g</u>
65.	(1) 2 x 12 x 10'	\$ <u>22.75_g</u>
66.	(1) 2 x 12 x 12'	\$ <u>30.50_g</u>
67.	(1) 2 x 12 x 16'	\$ <u>35.50_g</u>
68.	(1) 2 x 12 x 20'	\$ <u>61.20_g</u>
69.	(1) 4 x 4 x 8'	\$ <u>12.75_g</u>
70.	(1) 4 x 4 x 10'	\$ <u>15.50_g</u>
71.	(1) 4 x 4 x 12'	\$ <u>17.75_g</u>
72.	(1) 4 x 4 x 16'	\$ <u>24.50_g</u>
73.	(1) 4 x 4 x 20'	\$ <u>31.25_g</u>
74.	(1) 4 x 6 x 16'	\$ <u>36.50_g</u>
75.	(1) 4 x 8 x 16'	\$ <u>99.00_g</u>

VENDOR NAME: Effect Builders Materials DBA Liberty Building Products

Group Two (Continued)

76. (1) 4 x 8 x 20'

\$ 155.00

77. (1) 6 x 6 x 8'

\$ 27.50

78. (1) 6 x 6 x 10'

\$ 41.00

79. (1) 6 x 6 x 12'

\$ 43.50

80. (1) 6 x 6 x 16'

\$ 61.00

81. (1) 6 x 8 x 16'

\$ 155.00

82. (1) 6 x 12 x 20'

\$ 220.00

83. (1) 3/4" x 4' x 8', AZEK SHEET OR EQUIVALENT,
WHITE, SMOOTH FINISH

\$ 165.00

84. (1) 3/4" x 10" x 12', AZEK TRIM BOARD OR EQUIVALENT,
WHITE, SMOOTH FINISH

\$ 97.00

85. (1) 5/4" x 10" x 12', AZEK TRIM BOARD OR EQUIVALENT,
WHITE, SMOOTH FINISH

\$ 195.00

TOTAL GROUP TWO:

\$ 2,445.30

VENDOR NAME: Extech Building Materials DBA Liberty Buddy Products

Group Three- Hardwoods- White pine C select/moldings

86.	(1) 1 x 4 x 8' IDAHO	\$ _____/PC
87.	(1) 1 x 4 x 10' IDAHO	\$ _____/PC
88.	(1) 1 x 4 x 12' IDAHO	\$ _____/PC
89.	(1) 1 x 4 x 14' IDAHO	\$ _____/PC
90.	(1) 1 x 4 x 16' IDAHO	\$ _____/PC
91.	(1) 1 x 6 x 8' IDAHO	\$ _____/PC
92.	(1) 1 x 6 x 10' IDAHO	\$ _____/PC
93.	(1) 1 x 6 x 12' IDAHO	\$ _____/PC
94.	(1) 1 x 6 x 14' IDAHO	\$ _____/PC
95.	(1) 1 x 6 x 16' IDAHO	\$ _____/PC
96.	(1) 1 x 8 x 8' IDAHO	\$ _____/PC
97.	(1) 1 x 8 x 10' IDAHO	\$ _____/PC
98.	(1) 1 x 8 x 12' IDAHO	\$ _____/PC
99.	(1) 1 x 8 x 14' IDAHO	\$ _____/PC
100.	(1) 1 x 8 x 16' IDAHO	\$ _____/PC
101.	(1) 1 x 10 x 8' IDAHO	\$ _____/PC
102.	(1) 1 x 10 x 10' IDAHO	\$ _____/PC
103.	(1) 1 x 10 x 12' IDAHO	\$ _____/PC
104.	(1) 1 x 10 x 14' IDAHO	\$ _____/PC

NO Bid

VENDOR NAME: *Excellt Buildy Materials DBA Liberty Buildy Products*

Group Three (Continued)

- | | | |
|------|-----------------------------------|-------------|
| 105. | (1) 1 x 10 x 16' IDAHO | \$ _____/PC |
| 106. | (1) 1 x 12 x 8' IDAHO | \$ _____/PC |
| 107. | (1) 1 x 12 x 10' IDAHO | \$ _____/PC |
| 108. | (1) 1 x 12 x 12' IDAHO | \$ _____/PC |
| 109. | (1) 1 x 12 x 14' IDAHO | \$ _____/PC |
| 110. | (1) 1 x 12 x 16' IDAHO | \$ _____/PC |
| 111. | (1) 5/4 x 12 x 16' EASTERN | \$ _____/PC |
| 112. | (1) 8/4 x 6 x 12' EASTERN | \$ _____/PC |
| 113. | (1) 12/4 x 6 x 12' EASTERN RANDOM | \$ _____/PC |

No Bid

Moldings

- | | | |
|------|---|-------------|
| 114. | (1) 3/4" COVE INSIDE & OUTSIDE | \$ _____/LF |
| 115. | (1) 1 5/8" CEILING COVE | \$ _____/LF |
| 116. | (1) 3 1/4" RANCH BASE | \$ _____/LF |
| 117. | (1) 3 1/4" CLAM BASE | \$ _____/LF |
| 118. | (1) 1 1/8" CAP MOLDINGS | \$ _____/LF |
| 119. | (1) 2 1/4" CHAIR RAIL | \$ _____/LF |
| 120. | (1) 3 1/4" CHAIR RAIL | \$ _____/LF |
| 121. | (1) 2 1/4" x 9/16" RANCH CASING | \$ _____/LF |
| 122. | (1) 2 1/4" x 9/16" CLAM CASING | \$ _____/LF |
| 123. | (1) 2 1/8" STANDARD HANDRAIL (6' - 16' LENGTHS) | \$ _____/LF |

No Bid

VENDOR NAME: Excel Building Materials DBA Liberty Building Products

Group Three (Continued)

124. (1) 2 1/4" COLONIAL CASING \$ _____ /LF

125. (1) 2 1/2" COLONIAL CASING \$ _____ /LF

TOTAL GROUP THREE: \$ no bid

Group Four- Hardwood- FAS Grade, surfaced 2 sides, random width to 12", random length 6' to 16'

ALL GROUP FOUR PRICES ARE **PER- BOARD FOOT.**

126. (1) POPLAR, 4/4 FIRST & SECONDS, S2S \$ _____

127. (1) RED OAK, 4/4 FIRST & SECONDS, S2S \$ _____

128. (1) SOUTH AMERICAN MAHOGANY,
4/4 FIRST & SECONDS, S2S \$ _____

129. (1) WALNUT, 4/4 FIRST & SECONDS \$ _____

130. (1) HARD MAPLE, 4/4 FIRST & SECONDS \$ _____

131. (1) POPLAR, 5/4 FIRST & SECONDS, S2S \$ _____

132. (1) RED OAK, 5/4 FIRST & SECONDS, S2S \$ _____

133. (1) SOUTH AMERICAN MAHOGANY,
5/4", FIRST & SECONDS \$ _____

134. (1) WALNUT, 5/4 FIRST & SECONDS \$ _____

135. (1) HARD MAPLE, 5/4 FIRST & SECONDS \$ _____

136. (1) 6/4 x 12 x 16' TRUCK BODY OAK \$ _____

137. (1) 8/4 x 12 x 16' TRUCK BODY OAK \$ _____

no bid

VENDOR NAME: Exact Buildy Materials DBA Liberty Buildy Products

Group Four (Continued)

- 138. (1) 8/4 x 12 x 18' TRUCK BODY OAK \$ _____
- 139. (1) CEDAR WESTERN RED 5/4", FIRST & SECONDS \$ _____
- 140. (1) PECKY CYPRESS 4/4" & 5/4", FIRST & SECONDS \$ _____
- 141. (1) CHERRY (PENNSYLVANIA) 5/4", FIRST & SECONDS \$ _____
- 142. (1) WHITE BIRCH 5/4", SELECT & BETTER \$ _____
- 143. (1) 2" x 6" x 18' ROUGH SAWN OAK PLANKS \$ _____

TOTAL GROUP FOUR:

\$ 100 Bid 90

Group Five- Sheet Goods

ALL GROUP FIVE ITEMS ARE **PER PIECE**

- 144. (1) 1/4" x 4' x 8' FIR PLYWOOD EXTERIOR, AC \$ _____
- 145. (1) 3/8" x 4' x 8' FIR PLYWOOD EXTERIOR, AC \$ _____
- 146. (1) 1/2" x 4' x 8' FIR PLYWOOD EXTERIOR, AC \$ _____
- 147. (1) 5/8" x 4' x 8' FIR PLYWOOD EXTERIOR, AC \$ _____
- 148. (1) 3/4" x 4' x 8' FIR PLYWOOD EXTERIOR, AC \$ _____
- 149. (1) 1/2" x 4' x 8' FIR PLYWOOD EXTERIOR, CDX \$ _____
- 150. (1) 5/8" x 4' x 8' FIR PLYWOOD EXTERIOR, CDX \$ _____
- 151. (1) 3/4" x 4' x 8' FIR PLYWOOD EXTERIOR, CDX \$ _____
- 152. (1) 3/4" x 4' x 8' BIRCH FIRE RATED PLYWOOD \$ _____
- 153. (1) 3/4" x 4' x 8' PRESSURE TREATED PLYWOOD \$ _____

100 Bid

VENDOR NAME: Exact Bulky Materials DBA Liberty Bulky Products

Group Five (Continued)

- | | | |
|------|---|----------|
| 154. | (1) 1/2" X 4' X 8' PRESSURE TREATED PINE PLYWOOD | \$ _____ |
| 155. | (1) 1/4" x 4' x 8' NATURAL BIRCH PLYWOOD A-1, VC | \$ _____ |
| 156. | (1) 1/2" x 4' x 8' NATURAL BIRCH PLYWOOD A-1, VC | \$ _____ |
| 157. | (1) 3/4" x 4' x 8' NATURAL BIRCH PLYWOOD WPF A-1, VC | \$ _____ |
| 158. | (1) 1/4" x 4' x 8' RED OAK PLYWOOD PLAIN SLICED, A1, VC | \$ _____ |
| 159. | (1) 1/2" x 4' x 8' RED OAK PLYWOOD PLAIN SLICED, A1, VC | \$ _____ |
| 160. | (1) 3/4" x 4' x 8' RED OAK PLYWOOD PLAIN SLICED, A1, VC | \$ _____ |
| 161. | (1) 1/4" x 4' x 8' PLAIN SLICED AFRICAN MAHOGANY A4, VC | \$ _____ |
| 162. | (1) 1/2" x 4' x 8' PLAIN SLICED AFRICAN MAHOGANY A1, VC | \$ _____ |
| 163. | (1) 3/4" x 4' x 8' PLAIN SLICED AFRICAN MAHOGANY A1, VC | \$ _____ |
| 164. | (1) 1/4" x 4' x 8' PLAIN SLICED CHERRY PLYWOOD A1, VC | \$ _____ |
| 165. | (1) 3/4" x 4' x 8' PLAIN SLICED CHERRY PLYWOOD A1, VC | \$ _____ |
| 166. | (1) 1/4" x 4' x 8' PLAIN SLICED WHITE MAPLE A4, VC | \$ _____ |
| 167. | (1) 3/4" x 4' x 8' PLAIN SLICED WHITE MAPLE A1, VC | \$ _____ |
| 168. | (1) 1/4" x 4' x 8' PLAIN SLICED WALNUT PLYWOOD A4, VC | \$ _____ |
| 169. | (1) 3/4" x 4' x 8' PLAIN SLICED WALNUT PLYWOOD A1, VC | \$ _____ |
| 170. | (1) 5.2 MM x 4' x 8' (LAUAN) MERANTI VC EXT | \$ _____ |
| 171. | (1) 1/2" x 4' x 8' (LAUAN) MERANTI VC | \$ _____ |
| 172. | (1) 1/2" x 4' x 8' CORK BOARD | \$ _____ |
| 173. | (1) 3' x 5' CONCRETE BOARD (WONDER BOARD) 1/2" | \$ _____ |
| 174. | (1) 3' x 5' CONCRETE BOARD (WONDER BOARD) 1/4" | \$ _____ |
| 175. | (1) 1/4" x 4' x 8" TEMPERED PEG BOARD | \$ _____ |

VENDOR NAME: Excel Building Materials DBA Liberty Buddy Products

Group Five (Continued)

- | | | |
|------|--|----------|
| 176. | (1) 7/16" x 4' x 8" HOMOSOTE #440 | \$ _____ |
| 177. | (1) 1/8" x 4' x 8" TEMPERED MASONITE, 1 SIDE | \$ _____ |
| 178. | (1) 1/4" x 4' x 8" TEMPERED MASONITE, 1 SIDE | \$ _____ |
| 179. | (1) 5/8" x 4' x 8' FIR T 1-11 8" O.C. SHALL BE T 1-11 PLYWOOD SIDING, DOUGLAS FIR, EXTERIOR GLUE, GROOVES 8" APART, SOUND GRADE (MAXIMUM 18 PATCHES PER SHEET) | \$ _____ |
| 180. | (1) 3/4" x 4' x 8' A/C FIRE RATED PLYWOOD | \$ _____ |
| 181. | (1) 1/8" x 4' x 8' PLEXIGLASS (MASKED) | \$ _____ |
| 182. | (1) 1/4" x 4' x 8' PLEXIGLASS (MASKED) | \$ _____ |
| 183. | (1) 1/4" x 4' x 8' LEXAN | \$ _____ |
| 184. | (1) 1/4" x 4' x 8' LEXAN (WITH MIT GUARD) | \$ _____ |
| 185. | (1) 1/2" x 4' x 8' LEXAN (WITH MIT GUARD) | \$ _____ |
| 186. | (1) 1/2" x 4' x 8' LEXAN | \$ _____ |
| 187. | (1) 1/16" x 4' x 8' FORMICA BRAND (OR SIMILAR) SOLID COLOR OR PATTERN, HORIZONTAL USE, LAMINATE, GENERAL PURPOSE, STANDARD GRADE, MATTE FINISH | \$ _____ |
| 188. | (1) 1/16" x 4' x 8' FORMICA BRAND (OR SIMILAR) WOOD GRAIN OR PATTERN, HORIZONTAL USE, LAMINATE, GENERAL PURPOSE, STANDARD GRADE, MATTE FINISH | \$ _____ |
| 189. | (1) 1/16" x 4' x 10' FORMICA BRAND (OR SIMILAR) SOLID COLOR OR PATTERN, HORIZONTAL USE, LAMINATE, GENERAL PURPOSE, STANDARD GRADE, MATTE FINISH | \$ _____ |
| 190. | (1) 1/16" x 4' x 10' FORMICA BRAND (OR SIMILAR) WOOD GRAIN OR PATTERN, HORIZONTAL USE, LAMINATE, GENERAL PURPOSE, STANDARD GRADE, MATTE FINISH | \$ _____ |

Handwritten signature/initials

VENDOR NAME: extech buildy materials DBA Liberty buildy products

Group Five (Continued)

- 191. (1) 1/16" x 4' x 12' FORMICA BRAND (OR SIMILAR)
SOLID COLOR OR PATTERN, HORIZONTAL USE, LAMINATE,
GENERAL PURPOSE, STANDARD GRADE, MATTE FINISH \$ _____
- 192. (1) 1/16" x 4' x 12' FORMICA BRAND (OR SIMILAR)
WOOD GRAIN OR PATTERN, HORIZONTAL USE, LAMINATE,
GENERAL PURPOSE, STANDARD GRADE, MATTE FINISH \$ _____
- 193. (1) 1/16" x 5' x 8' FORMICA BRAND (OR SIMILAR)
SOLID COLOR OR PATTERN, HORIZONTAL USE, LAMINATE,
GENERAL PURPOSE, STANDARD GRADE, MATTE FINISH \$ _____
- 194. 1/16" x 5' x 8' FORMICA BRAND (OR SIMILAR)
WOOD GRAIN OR PATTERN, HORIZONTAL USE, LAMINATE,
GENERAL PURPOSE, STANDARD GRADE, MATTE FINISH \$ _____
- 195. 1/16" x 5' x 10' FORMICA BRAND (OR SIMILAR)
SOLID COLOR OR PATTERN, HORIZONTAL USE, LAMINATE,
GENERAL PURPOSE, STANDARD GRADE, MATTE FINISH \$ _____
- 196. 1/16" x 5' x 10' FORMICA BRAND (OR SIMILAR)
WOOD GRAIN OR PATTERN, HORIZONTAL USE, LAMINATE,
GENERAL PURPOSE, STANDARD GRADE, MATTE FINISH \$ _____
- 197. (1) 1/16" x 5' x 12' FORMICA BRAND (OR SIMILAR)
SOLID COLOR OR PATTERN, HORIZONTAL USE, LAMINATE,
GENERAL PURPOSE, STANDARD GRADE, MATTE FINISH \$ _____
- 198. (1) 1/16" x 5' x 12' FORMICA BRAND (OR SIMILAR)
WOOD GRAIN OR PATTERN, HORIZONTAL USE, LAMINATE,
GENERAL PURPOSE, STANDARD GRADE, MATTE FINISH \$ _____
- 199. (1) 5' x 10' x 3/4" PARTICLE BOARD \$ _____
- 200. 3/4" x 49" x 97" MELAMINE, VARIOUS COLORS &
WOOD GRAINS \$ _____
- 201. 1/4" X 4' X 8' MOISTURE RESISTANT BACKER BOARD
(HARDEE OR EQUIVALENT) \$ _____

No Bid

VENDOR NAME: Bestech Building Materials and Liberty Building Products

Group Five (Continued)

- 202. (1) 1/2" X 4' X 8' MOISTURE RESISTANT BACKER BOARD (HARDEE OR EQUIVALENT) \$ _____
- 203. (1) 13/16" X 250' PVC/POLYESTER EDGEBANDING, (PRE-GLUED) VARIOUS COLORS & WOOD GRAINS \$ _____
- 204. (1) 13/16" X 250' MAHOGANY EDGEBANDING (PRE-GLUED) \$ _____
- 205. (1) 13/16" X 250' NATURAL BIRCH EDGEBANDING (PRE-GLUED) \$ _____
- 206. (1) 13/16" X 250' MAPLE EDGEBANDING (PRE-GLUED) \$ _____
- 207. (1) 13/16" X 250' RED OAK EDGEBANDING (PRE-GLUED) \$ _____
- 208. (1) 13/16" X 250' CHERRY EDGEBANDING (PRE-GLUED) \$ _____
- 209. (1) 13/16" X 250' WALNUT EDGEBANDING (PRE-GLUED) \$ _____
- 210. (1) 1OZ KAMPEL SEAMFILL TUBES (VARIOUS COLORS) \$ _____

TOTAL GROUP FIVE: \$ 10 Bid (70)

Group Six- Select Structural Lumber

ALL GROUP SIX PRICES MUST BE PER PIECE

ALL GROUP SIX PRICES MUST BE **PER PIECE**

- 211. 2" X 4" X 16' SELECT STRUCTURAL, CCA RETENTION GRADE: 2.5, FOR SALTWATER CONTACT, DRESSED TO NOMINAL SIZE, (D4S)
- 212. 3" x 10" x 20' SELECT STRUCTURAL, CCA RETENTION GRADE: 2.5, FOR SALTWATER CONTACT, DRESSED TO NOMINAL SIZE, (D4S)

\$ Bid
\$ _____

VENDOR NAME: Estech Bulky Materials DBA Liberty Bulky Products

Group Six (Continued)

- 213. (1) 4" X 8" X 20' SELECT STRUCTURAL, CCA
RETENTION GRADE: 2.5, FOR SALTWATER CONTACT,
DRESSED TO NOMINAL SIZE, (D4S) \$ _____

- 214. 4" X 8" X 24' SELECT STRUCTURAL, CCA
RETENTION GRADE: 2.5, FOR SALTWATER CONTACT,
DRESSED TO NOMINAL SIZE, (D4S) \$ _____

- 215. 6" X 8" X 20' SELECT STRUCTURAL, CCA
RETENTION GRADE: 2.5, FOR SALTWATER CONTACT,
DRESSED TO NOMINAL SIZE, (D4S) \$ _____

- 216. 6" X 12" X 20' SELECT STRUCTURAL, CCA
RETENTION GRADE: 2.5, FOR SALTWATER CONTACT,
DRESSED TO NOMINAL SIZE, (D4S) \$ _____

- 217. 6" X 16" X 20' SELECT STRUCTURAL, CCA
RETENTION GRADE: 2.5, FOR SALTWATER CONTACT,
DRESSED TO NOMINAL SIZE, (D4S) \$ _____

- 218. 12" X 12" X 30' SELECT STRUCTURAL, CCA
RETENTION GRADE: 2.5, FOR SALTWATER CONTACT,
DRESSED TO NOMINAL SIZE, (D4S) \$ _____

- 219. 4" X 8" X 20' TONGUE & GROOVE SELECT STRUCTURAL,
CCA RETENTION GRADE: 2.5, FOR SALTWATER CONTACT,
DRESSED TO NOMINAL SIZE, (D4S) \$ _____

- 220. 1"x 5"x 16' WOOD/PLASTIC COMPOSITE BOARD
VARIOUS COLORS \$ _____

- 221. 2"x 4"x 16' WOOD/PLASTIC COMPOSITE BOARD
VARIOUS COLORS \$ _____

- 222. 2"x 6"x 16' WOOD/PLASTIC COMPOSITE BOARD
VARIOUS COLORS \$ _____

AW
BID

TOTAL GROUP SIX: \$ no bid

VENDOR NAME: Bateoff Buddy Materials DBA Liberty Buddy Products

SUMMARY PAGE – ENTER TOTAL AMOUNT PER GROUP

GROUP ONE (1 – 35)	\$ <u>587,45</u>
GROUP TWO (36 – 85)	\$ <u>2,445,30</u>
GROUP THREE (86 – 125)	\$ <u>no Bid</u>
GROUP FOUR (126 – 143)	\$ <u>no Bid</u>
GROUP FIVE (144 – 210)	\$ <u>no Bid</u>
GROUP SIX (211 – 222)	\$ <u>no Bid</u>

NOTE:

This bid will be awarded on a **PER GROUP BASIS**.

The low bid for each group will be determined by totaling all unit prices within the group. however, final award amount will not exceed departments budgetary amounts.

ALL ITEMS MUST BE BID UPON IN A GROUP TO BE CONSIDERED FOR AWARD. IF GROUP IS INCOMPLETE, IT WILL NOT BE EVALUATED.

Please submit all bid inquires in writing to:
formalbidquestions@co.monmouth.nj.us

VENDOR NAME: Extect H Buldy materials DBA Liberty Buldy Products